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Erratum et Addendum

H. FERY

Recently, a paper on a few Hydradephaga from the Persian Gulf region was published in
this journal (FERY et al. 2012). Unfortunately, in the legend of one figure table the first
two species names have been mixed up by mistake. This legend must be:
"Figs 13-15: Habitus of (13) Hygrotus orthogrammus, (14) Hyphoporus solieri, (15)
Canthydrus laetabilis."

In the same paper Glareadessus franzi WEWALKA & BISTRÖM 1998 was reported from
two new localities. Because the distribution as well as the life history of this species
remain poorly known, a further record shall be added here which was unknown to the
authors when preparing their manuscript. This record has been communicated recently
by J. HÁJEK (NMPC, Národní muzeum, Prague, Czech Republic), who found a single
male at a locality about 7 km east of the locality "Rudan stream" given in FERY et. al.
(2012) and about 18 km west of the type locality of this species (Manoojān). The exact
label data are: "Iran, 16.-17.IV.2000, Hormozgan Prov., 10 km E Dehbarez (27°27'N
57°19'E)", "Iran 2000, Czech Biological Expedition, J. Hájek & M. Mikát leg.",
"Glareadessus franzi Wewalka & Biström, 1998, Jiří Hájek det. 2000, compared with the
type in the NHM Vienna". The collecting site is a large wadi, which included at that time
only a small meandering stream about one meter wide. The specimen was collected at the
side of the wadi near an area where the stream disappeared under the ground, re-
emerging two metres below.
Other Hydradephaga collected in that stream were Deronectes hendrichi FERY &
HOSSEINIE 1998, Hydroglyphus hormuzensis HÁJEK & BRANCUCCI 2011, Laccophilus
maindroni persicus BRANCUCCI 1983, and Dineutus indicus AUBÉ 1838.
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